
ANNEX A  
 

LIST OF NEW SKILLSFUTURE WORK-STUDY PROGRAMMES 
 
1. New SkillsFuture Work-Study Programme offered by Ngee Ann Polytechnic in 
partnership with NCS  
 
SkillsFuture Work-Study CerNficate leading to Part-Time Diploma in Full Stack 
Development  
 
To support the growth and advancement of the Infocomm Technology (ICT) sector, the 
SkillsFuture Work-Study CerAficate leading to Part-Time Diploma in Full Stack Development 
opens a new pathway for individuals keen to develop new skills and knowledge as Associate 
SoFware Engineers and SoFware Tester Quality Assurance Engineers. 
  
Ngee Ann Polytechnic’s School of ICT has worked with NCS to co-develop the programme 
curriculum to meet the industry’s rapidly evolving needs, while aligning the course with the 
naAon’s Skills Framework for ICT.  
 
2. New SkillsFuture Work-Study Programme jointly offered by Republic Polytechnic and 
Singapore Polytechnic in partnership with NCS  
 
SkillsFuture Work-Study CerNficate leading to Part-Time Diploma in SoSware Engineering 
  
The SkillsFuture Work-Study CerAficate leading to a part-Ame Diploma in SoFware 
Engineering is a first-of-its-kind programme to develop competent and skilled soFware 
engineering professionals. ParAcipants will gain knowledge and skills in areas including 
soFware development, cloud compuAng and arAficial intelligence.  
 
Upon compleAon of the programme, graduates can take on job roles such as soFware 
engineers, DevOps engineers or UI designers in the ICT sector.  
 
3. New SkillsFuture Work-Study Programmes by Singapore Polytechnic  
 
a) SkillsFuture Work-Study CerNficate leading to a part-Nme Diploma in Business PracNce 
(Business Management)  
 
The SkillsFuture Work-Study CerAficate leading to a part-Ame Diploma in Business PracAce 
(Business Management) aims to provide parAcipants with foundaAonal skillsets to take on 
customer service, sales and markeAng-related job roles across various sectors in the 
industry, parAcularly the retail and wholesale trade sectors.  
 
 
 
 
 



b) SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Advanced Diploma in Applied Science and 
Engineering [Microelectronics and Materials])  
 
The SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Advanced Diploma in Applied Science and 
Engineering [Microelectronics and Materials]) will provide parAcipants with broad-based 
science and engineering training, with an emphasis on concepts and applicaAons of 
advanced materials within the pillar of specialty chemicals and microelectronics industry. It 
will also equip parAcipants with essenAal laboratory skills in formulaAons as well as 
performance evaluaAon of advanced materials.  
 
c) SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Full Stack Web 
Development)  
 
ParAcipants enrolled in the SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Full 
Stack Web Development) will get to learn modern web technologies such as Progressive 
Web Apps, React JS and React NaAve to deliver opAmised and reliable web soluAons. They 
will also learn to use JavaScript, a crucial skill for any web developer. At the end of the 
programme, parAcipants will be able to develop responsive web applicaAons with web 
services support.  
 
4. New SkillsFuture Work-Study Programmes by Temasek Polytechnic  
 
a) SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Design for Integrated 
CommunicaNon)  
 
With the growing importance for brands to connect with digitally savvy consumers, good UX 
design is criAcal to create seamless and engaging user experiences. The SkillsFuture Work-
Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Design for Integrated CommunicaAon) will equip 
parAcipants with knowledge on UX design principles, design and innovaAon strategies, and 
technological proficiency. This programme is offered by Temasek Polytechnic School of 
Design in collaboraAon with General Assembly.  
 
b) SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Interior Design PracNce)  
 
The SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Interior Design PracAce) 
offers a unique combinaAon of business management and design. The programme aims to 
equip parAcipants with the knowledge, skills and a[ributes to successfully manage interior 
design projects. ParAcipants can learn about the latest interior design business trends and 
how to market their interior design business and effecAvely manage clients.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



c) SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Sustainable Fashion)  
 
With the growing interest in sustainable fashion, the SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma 
(Specialist Diploma in Sustainable Fashion) offered in collaboraAon with the Singapore 
Fashion Council provides parAcipants with the necessary skills and knowledge on areas such 
as sustainable materials, manufacturing processes and sustainable concepts in the fashion 
business to meet evolving sustainability requirements.  
 
d) SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Sustainable Built 
Environment)  
 
With the emergence of the green economy, the demand for jobs roles that require green 
skills across mulAple sectors is growing exponenAally. To meet this growing manpower 
demand, the SkillsFuture Work-Study Post-Diploma (Specialist Diploma in Sustainable Built 
Environment) aims to train the next generaAon of paraprofessionals for the Built 
Environment sector. Offered in collaboraAon with the Building and ConstrucAon Authority, 
the programme will enable its parAcipants to learn about the latest trends and innovaAons 
in sustainable building pracAces, and regulatory and policy frameworks governing 
sustainable development. 
 
 


